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Justice Henry Brown delivered the majority opinion of the Court: 
 
… The object of the [Fourteenth] amendment was undoubtedly to enforce the 
absolute equality of the two races before the law, but, in the nature of things, it could 
not have been intended to abolish distinctions based upon color, or to enforce social, 
as distinguished from political, equality, or a commingling of the two races upon 
terms unsatisfactory to either. Laws permitting, and even requiring, their separation, 
in places where they are liable to be brought into contact, do not necessarily imply 
the inferiority of either race to the other, and have been generally, if not universally, 
recognized as within the competency of the state legislatures in the exercise of their 
police power. The most common instance of this is connected with the 
establishment of separate schools for white and colored children, which have been 
held to be a valid exercise of the legislative power even by courts of states where the 
political rights of the colored race have been longest and most earnestly enforced. 
… 
We consider the underlying fallacy of the plaintiff's argument to consist in the 
assumption that the enforced separation of the two races stamps the colored race 
with a badge of inferiority. If this be so, it is not by reason of anything found in the 
act, but solely because the colored race chooses to put that construction upon it. … 
If the two races are to meet upon terms of social equality, it must be the result of 
natural affinities, a mutual appreciation of each other's merits, and a voluntary 
consent of individuals. …If the civil and political rights of both races be equal, one 
cannot be inferior to the other civilly or politically. If one race be inferior to the 
other socially, the constitution of the United States cannot put them upon the same 
plane. 
 
 
Justice John Marshall Harlan dissented: 
 
…I am of opinion that the state of Louisiana is inconsistent with the personal liberty 
of citizens, white and black, in that state, and hostile to both the spirit and letter of 
the constitution of the United States. If laws of like character should be enacted in 
the several states of the Union, the effect would be in the highest degree 
mischievous. Slavery, as an institution tolerated by law, would, it is true, have 
disappeared from our country; but there would remain a power in the states, by 
sinister legislation, to interfere with the full enjoyment of the blessings of freedom, 
to regulate civil rights, common to all citizens, upon the basis of race, and to place in 
a condition of legal inferiority a large body of American citizens, now constituting a 
part of the political community, called the 'People of the United States,' for whom, 
and by whom through representatives, our government is administered…. 
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